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Using Copernicanism, Darwinism, and Freudianism as examples of scientific
traditions, Copernicus, Darwin and Freud takes a philosophical look at these
three revolutions in thought to illustrate the connections between science and
philosophy.

Shows how these revolutions in thought lead to philosophical consequences●

Provides extended case studies of Copernicanism, Darwinism, and Freudianism●

Integrates the history of science and the philosophy of science like no other text●

Covers both the philosophy of natural and social science in one volume●
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Editorial Review

Review
"Whether used as a textbook or as a review of issues concerning scientific revolutions and theory change in
their historical context, Copernicus, Darwin, and Freud may be strongly recommended." (The Journal of the
International Society for the History of Philosophy of Science, 2011)

"Those seeking a more conventional approach to the history and philosophy of science may well find
Weinert's book informative...there is much to be learned from Weinert's comparison of Copernicus, Darwin,
and Freud." (Science & Education, January 2011)

Review
"Why is Darwin less the Copernicus than the Kepler of biology ? What are good criteria for scientific
revolutions? Shift of perspective? Replacement of paradigms? Reweaving conceptual networks? Explanatory
gain? Restructuring the constraint space? Threatening worldviews? Whoever wants to learn more about these
and many other important issues of history & philosophy of science will have to read on!"
–Klaus Hentschel, full professor for history of science & technology, University of Stuttgart

"Friedel Weinert has done a rare and excellent thing in this book: he has shown how the philosophy of
science is intimately connected with the development of physical, biological and social sciences and that
argument concerning the foundations of these sciences cannot be advanced with out reference to philosophy.
It is a clearly written and engaging book that will be informative for teachers, students and the lay public
alike."
–Robert Nola, Dept of Philosophy, the University of Auckland

From the Back Cover
Scientific ideas change the way we think about the world and our place in it. Nicolaus Copernicus developed
a heliocentric view of the cosmos that displaced humans from the physical center of the universe. Charles
Darwin developed an evolutionary theory that placed humans firmly within the organismic order of nature. It
was Sigmund Freud who saw himself as completing this cycle of disparagement by destroying the belief that
humans were ‘masters in their own house’.

Copernicus, Darwin and Freud: Revolutions in the History and Philosophy of Science deals with issues in
the area of intersection between history and philosophy of natural and social science. Using Copernicanism,
Darwinism and Freudianism as extended case studies, Friedel Weinert illustrates the profound connections
between science and philosophy and shows how scientific theories invariably have philosophical
consequences. Philosophical controversies surrounding ideas of human nature, realism and instrumentalism,
models and theories, laws of nature and scientific method are all examined within the context of concrete
problem situations in the history of science.

Copernicus, Darwin and Freud is an engaging and versatile text suitable for a variety of courses in the
history and philosophy of science or for individual study.



Users Review

From reader reviews:

Darrell Fowler:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking Copernicus, Darwin and Freud:
Revolutions in the History and Philosophy of Science that give your fun preference will be satisfied by
means of reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to
know world a great deal better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be stated constantly
that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to end up being success person.
So , for all you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you could pick Copernicus, Darwin and
Freud: Revolutions in the History and Philosophy of Science become your personal starter.

Lorena Repass:

This Copernicus, Darwin and Freud: Revolutions in the History and Philosophy of Science is fresh way for
you who has fascination to look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger of knowledge.
Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having little digest in reading
this Copernicus, Darwin and Freud: Revolutions in the History and Philosophy of Science can be the light
food in your case because the information inside that book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books
produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book type. People who think that
in book form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So ,
don't miss that! Just read this e-book kind for your better life and knowledge.

Craig Brown:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading.
Some people likes examining, not only science book but novel and Copernicus, Darwin and Freud:
Revolutions in the History and Philosophy of Science as well as others sources were given knowledge for
you. After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science e-book was created
for teacher or even students especially. Those guides are helping them to bring their knowledge. In other
case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Copernicus, Darwin and Freud: Revolutions in the History
and Philosophy of Science to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Katrina Hering:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social media.
You can choose the very best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It
is called of book Copernicus, Darwin and Freud: Revolutions in the History and Philosophy of Science. You
can include your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and
make you actually happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about book. It can bring you
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